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xv

The federal Endangered Species Act (ESA) of the United States has the
admirable goal of minimizing extinction rates through regulations and ac-
tions that are intended to produce recovery of species that are in critical
decline. For any given species listed under the act, agencies implementing
the ESA must choose from an immense array of possibilities the ones most
likely to lead to recovery, and in doing so they must forego the luxury of an
extended interval of monitoring or experimentation.

Remedies for the recovery of species often have harmful or at least frus-
trating effects on people and institutions. In such instances, the affected
parties often are especially dissatisfied with the implementation of remedies
that are not absolutely secure scientifically. But the ESA does not allow
delay, which would defeat its purpose. Thus, some of the remedies pre-
scribed by agencies ultimately will prove ineffective and may cause eco-
nomic or social disruption without any tangible benefit to listed species.

The National Research Council’s Committee on Endangered and
Threatened Fishes in the Klamath River Basin deals in its final report with
three Klamath basin fish species listed under the federal ESA. The com-
mittee’s work is broad in that it encompasses the entire actual or potential
range of those species in the Klamath basin, regardless of the boundaries set
by ownership or management, and with all the potential environmental
changes that could suppress or promote the welfare of the species. The com-
mittee, in response to its charge, has given particular attention to evaluation
of the certainty underlying specific kinds of remedies that might lead to the
recovery of species. The issues that the committee has dealt with are specific

Preface
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xvi PREFACE

to the basin, but the Klamath basin presents in microcosm most of the prob-
lems that are generally identified with implementation of the ESA. Espe-
cially prominent in the Klamath basin is controversy over the extent to which
remedies that have uncertain outcomes should be pursued even though they
are economically or socially painful.

One issue especially well highlighted by the Klamath basin is the rela-
tive weight that should be given to professional judgment as opposed to
direct empirical evidence that appears to be contradictory to that judgment.
Whereas professional judgment is essential for successful ESA implementa-
tions where site-specific information is absent, its use is more problematic
when initial judgments fail empirical tests. Reversal of an initial judgment
may seem to be an abandonment of duty or principle, but it is unrealistic to
expect that all initial judgments will be proved scientifically sound. By rais-
ing this issue in specific terms in its interim report, the committee has gener-
ated considerable controversy in the Klamath basin. The committee believes,
however, that a rational and consistent resolution of the issue works toward
the long-term stability and effectiveness of the ESA. The committee’s final
report gives a more detailed view of the committee’s approach.

The committee owes a great debt of gratitude to the National Research
Council staff members who have guided it through the production of the
final report. Suzanne van Drunick, project director, has been especially criti-
cal to the success of the committee; David Policansky, James Reisa, and
Bryan Shipley also helped the committee in numerous ways; Norman
Grossblatt, Mirsada Karalic-Loncarevic, and Kelly Clark helped with the
many details that made the report ready for publication. The committee is
also appreciative of James MacMahon and other board members for their
oversight of this study. The committee is grateful to Leslie Northcott of the
University of Colorado for helping to produce the manuscript of the report
and to Marylee Murphy and Rebecca Anthony of the University of Colo-
rado for their work on figures and tables.

The committee benefited immensely from the help and advice of scien-
tists and administrators who have dealt with environmental issues in the
Klamath basin and to contributions from the citizens, organizations, and
tribes working and living in the basin. The committee’s highest hope is that
its work will be a contribution to the long-term general welfare of everyone
who resides in, visits, or cares about the Klamath basin.

The National Research Council process for producing the report in-
volves extensive reliance on external reviewers. The committee thanks the
reviewers of its final report for their thoughtful contributions.

William M. Lewis, Jr., Chair
Committee on Endangered and Threatened
Fishes in the Klamath River Basin
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